

Bid Package: 0210 Building Cleaning

Bidder	Access Services	Arguello Family Investments DBA Ace Handyman Services	AEGJ Construction LLC	Boller Logistics LLC	Bratton Fi	nal Cleaning		te Exterior ces LLC	Classis Cleaning	Elite	Eco Clean	Op Constr	en Door ruction LLC
Base Bid	MOBID	19,200.00	122,082.	29,721.00	No	BID	40	BID	47,777.77	ИО	BID	110	BID
Alternate OPA-A1		0	0	6					0				
Alternate OPA-A2		0	Ο,	0					O		72		
Alternate OPA-A3		0	0	0					0				
Addenda Acknowledged		1-2 /	<b>/</b>	1-2 ✓		V			/				
Clarifications Acknowledged		1-4	<b>✓</b>	1-4 /					<b>V</b>				
Bid Signature									1-4				
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)		✓	<b>✓</b>	<b>✓</b>					/		7	V	/
Bid Bond Attached and Signed	1												



Bid Package: 0210 Building Cleaning

Perfect Fit Clear Services	aning RedFor LLC			2				
No BID	49,975.00							
	0							
	0	Ř						
	O							
	1-2							
	1-4 /							
4								
	*							*
_	No BID	NO BID 49,975.60  0  1-2  1-4  1-4  /	Services  NO BID  49,975.00  0  1-2 /  1-4 /	Services  NO BID  49,975.60  0  1-2 /  1-4 /	Services  NO BID  49,975.00  0  1-2 /  1-4 /  /	Services  NO BID  49,975.00  0  1-2 /  1-4 /  /	Services  NO 810  49,975.00  0  1-2 \ 1-4 \  1-4 \  1 \  1 \  1 \  1 \  1 \  1 \  1 \	Services  NO 81D 49,945.00  0  1-2 /  1-4 /  /



Bid Package: 0240 Demolition & Abatement

Bidder	Clean Air Environmental Inc.	Clear Site Industrial,	Custom Demo & Dismantling	EMR Services LLC	Fos	s Demolition		Construction LLC	RCI Dem	olition LLC	Trifecta Services DBA Trifecta	
Base Bid	49,000	40 810	46,658.00	109,350.00	И0	B(0	110	BID	ho	BID	75, 750.00	
Alternate OPA-A1	1/12		2/4	4/4							0	17
Alternate OPA-A2	NA		NID	N/A					1		0	
Alternate OPA-A3	NA		Nlv	NA							0	
Addenda Acknowledged	1-2 /		\-Z	1-2 1							1-2 /	
Clarifications Acknowledged	1-4 /		1-3 1	1-4 /							1-2	
Bid Signature											1-2 /	
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)	<b>✓</b>					1	,	<b>\</b>	1			
Bid Bond Attached and Signed		7	€									





Bid Package: 0300 Turnkey Concrete

Bidder	DSG Concrete Contractors	Evans Contracting Group, LLC	Ground Thunder Construction Inc.	Lorenzo Construction LLC		
Base Bid	NIA	N/A	N/A	N/A		
Alternate OPA-A1						
Alternate OPA-A2						
Alternate OPA-A3						
Addenda Acknowledged						
Clarifications Acknowledged						
Bid Signature						
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)						
Bid Bond Attached and Signed	1		J	1		





Bid Package: 0400 Masonry

Bidder	Gates Construction Co. Inc.	GE Masonry	Old North State Masonry LLC	Pyramid Masonry Contractors, Inc.	Summa Contracting	Vega Construction Company Inc.		
Base Bid	NIA	NA	N/A	NIA	NIA	NA		
Alternate OPA-A1								
Alternate OPA-A2								
Alternate OPA-A3								
Addenda Acknowledged							, ,	$\bigcirc$ $X$
Clarifications Acknowledged								
Bid Signature								
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)								
Bid Bond Attached and Signed	4	1			1	<b>1</b>		



Bid Package: 0500 Structural and Miscellaneous Steel

Bidder	Division 5	Lowder Steel	Sanford Steel Corp.	SteelFab, Inc.	Steel Fab Inc., York SC	Steel and Pipe Construction		
Base Bid	No BID	NO BID	40 810	no BID	27, 486,00	HO BID		
Alternate OPA-A1					11/A			¥
Alternate OPA-A2					N/A			
Alternate OPA-A3					N/A			
Addenda Acknowledged					1-2 1			
Clarifications Acknowledged					1-3 /			
Bid Signature								
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)					<b>✓</b>			
Bid Bond Attached and Signed	7	<b>1</b>		1				
							*	



Bid Package: 0600 Trim & Millwork

Atlantic Commercial Caseworks	Ike's Construction, Inc.				_			
57,910.00	50,000.00							
0	M/A							
0	A   U							
0	N/A							
1-2 1	1-2							
1-4	1-3							
	<b>✓</b>							
	Caseworks  57,910.00  0  0  1-2  1-4  1-4  1-4	Caseworks  57,910.00  50,000.00  N/A  N/A  N/A  1-2  1-3  /	Caseworks  57,910.00  50,000.00  N/A  N/A  1-2  1-3  /	Caseworks  57,910.00  50,000.00  N/A  N/A  N/A  1-2  1-3  1-3	Caseworks  Res Constitution, me.  57, 910.00 50, 000.00  0 N/A  0 N/A  1-Z / 1-Z /  1-4 / 1-3 /	Caseworks  Fe S Constitution, Inc.  57, 910.00  50, 000.00  0  N/A  0  N/A  1-2  1-2  1-3  /  /  /  /  /  /  /  /  /  /  /  /  /	Caseworks   Re & Constitución, Inc.	Caseworks  10



Bid Package: 0810 Doors, Frames & Hardware

Bidder	Cook & Boardman	McGraw Door	Schiller			
Base Bid	64,605.00	NO BID	64,270.00			
Alternate OPA-A1	0		0			
Alternate OPA-A2	0		0			
Alternate OPA-A3	0		Ò			
Addenda Acknowledged	1-2 /		1-2			
Clarifications Acknowledged	1-4 1		1-4			
Bid Signature						
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)	<b>✓</b>					
Bid Bond Attached and Signed						



Bid Package: 0840 Aluminum & Glass

Bidder	Carolina Classic Window & Glass	Karsey Glass	MSJ Glass and Glazing, Inc.	Precisi	on Glazing	AI			
Base Bid	149,037,00	138,700.00	139,974.00	40	BIP	162,625.00			
Alternate OPA-A1	NA	0	NIA			1/4			
Alternate OPA-A2	N/A	0	N/A			N/A			
Alternate OPA-A3	N/A	0	N/A			NIA			
Addenda Acknowledged	1-2 /	1-2 /	1-2			1-2			
Clarifications Acknowledged	1-4 /	1-4 /	1-4 /			1-2			
Bid Signature		40							
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)	<b>✓</b>		✓		V	<b>✓</b>			
Bid Bond Attached and Signed									
							A		



Bid Package: 0920 Drywall

Bidder	AEGJ Construction LL	C Bonitz, Inc.	Genesis Construction of the Carolinas Inc.	NJR Construction LLC	Sears Contract	Vasquez Drywall Systems Inc		
Base Bid	No BID	No BID	75, 450.17	No 610	150,350.00	47,000.00	NO BID	
Alternate OPA-A1			6		NA	NA		
Alternate OPA-A2			0		N/A	NIA		
Alternate OPA-A3			0		NIA	N/A		
Addenda Acknowledged			1-2		1	1-2 /		
Clarifications Acknowledged			1-4 /		1-4	1-3		
Bid Signature								
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)			<b>✓</b>			<b>✓</b>		
Bid Bond Attached and Signed		1						
-								



Bid Package: 0950 Acoustical Tile

Bidder	Acousti Engineering Company	Bonitz, Inc.	Genesis Construction of the Carolinas Inc.	Heartland Acoustics & Interiors	Northedge, LLC	Paul Barbour & Son	Sears Contract	United Painting Services, Inc.	Vasquez Drywall Systems Inc
Base Bid	24,673.00	40 B10	47,227.97	40 B10	40 Blo	No BIO	30,536.00	46,584.00	27,000.00
Alternate OPA-A1	NA		0				NA	NA	NA
Alternate OPA-A2	N/A		O				N/A	NA	N/A
Alternate OPA-A3	N/A		0				N/A	N/A	N/A
Addenda Acknowledged	1-2		1-2			\ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \	(	1-2 /	1-2 /
Clarifications Acknowledged	1-4		1-4 /				1-4 /	1-4 /	1-3
Bid Signature									
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)	✓		✓	1		4	<b>/</b>		
Bid Bond Attached and Signed									



Bid Package: 0950 Acoustical Tile

Bidder	Warco	Construction				
Base Bid	No	BID				
Alternate OPA-A1	9					
Alternate OPA-A2						
Alternate OPA-A3						
Addenda Acknowledged						
Clarifications Acknowledged	ŧ					
Bid Signature						
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)						
Bid Bond Attached and Signed	,	4				



Bid Package: 0960 Resilient & Carpet

Bidder	Atlanta Flooring Design Centers, Inc.	Bonitz, Inc.	Carpet Queen	Conco	rdia Building	Furnish My Place	Garmon & Company Commercial Flooring	TileSetters of Raleigh	
Base Bid	33, 858.00	No BID	43,600.06	No	BIO	39,300.00	30,470.00	he DID	
Alternate OPA-A1	NA		0			NIA	NIA		
Alternate OPA-A2	N/A		0	()	1	NIA	N/A		
Alternate OPA-A3	NIA		0		1	NIA	N/A		
Addenda Acknowledged	1-2 /		1-2 /			12 1	1-2 \		
Clarifications Acknowledged	1-4		1-4 /			1-4 /	1-4 /		
Bid Signature									
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)			<b>√</b>						
Bid Bond Attached and Signed		J							
9.									



Bid Package: 0990 Painting

Bidder	AEGJ Construction LLC	Bobbys Painting Company, Inc.		nond Touch nstruction	Stancil Painting		Commercial ainters	United Painting Services, Inc.	BRANDY'S PAINTING	
Base Bid	137,589.34	10,797,00	No	BIO	53,154.00	Ио	BIP	23,873.∞	40,500,00	
Alternate OPA-A1	0	0			0	,		4/4	4/4	
Alternate OPA-A2	0	0			0			N/A	NIA	
Alternate OPA-A3	0	0			0			N/A	NIA	
Addenda Acknowledged	1-2 1	1-2 /			1-2 /			1-2 1	1-2	
Clarifications Acknowledged	1-4 /	1-3			1-4 /			1-2	1-4	
Bid Signature									_	
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)	✓	<b>✓</b>	\		<b>/</b>			<b>/</b>		
Bid Bond Attached and Signed										



Investm	ents DBA Ace			Cook &	z Boardman	Genesis Construction of the Carolinas Inc	James Hall	Ventures, LLC	Nyco	on Inc.	RC Specialties	So	chiller	Sterling	Construction rvices
No	BID	No	BID	MO	OIG	63,384.63	NO	BIP	No	BID	21,606.00	NO	B10	No	BID
						0					NA				
						0					N/A				
						0					N/A				
						1-2					1-2				
						1-4 /					1-4 /				
						<b>✓</b>					<b>1</b>				
1			ı	`	Ţ				1			1		,	
	_														
										4:					
	Investm Ha	Arguello Family Investments DBA Ace Handyman  NO BID	Investments DBA Ace Handyman  NO BID  NO	Investments DBA Ace Handyman  NO BID  NO BID	Investments DBA Ace Handyman  NO BID  NO BID	Investments DBA Ace Handyman  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID	Investments DBA Ace Handyman  NO BID  NO BID	Investments DBA Ace   Handyman   B.A. Hoft of Charlotte,   Inc.   the Carolinas Inc	Investments DBA Ace Handyman  NO BID  NO BID	Investments DBA Ace Handyman  NO BID  NO BID	Investments DBA Ace Handyman  B.A. Hoft of Charlotte, Inc.  Inc.  NO BID  NO B	No   BID   No   BID	No   BID   No   BID	No   BID   No   BID	No   BID   No   BID



Bid Package: 1000 Specialties

Bidder	Warco Construction					
Base Bid	38, 900.66					-
Alternate OPA-A1	N(A					
Alternate OPA-A2	N/A					
Alternate OPA-A3	NA					
Addenda Acknowledged	1-2					
Clarifications Acknowledged	1-4					
Bid Signature						
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)	<b>/</b>					
Bid Bond Attached and Signed						
		_				



Bid Package: 1020 Signage

Bidder	AOA Signs, Inc.	Signarama - Pineville				
Base Bid	4,996.00	NIA				
Alternate OPA-A1	ð					
Alternate OPA-A2	0					
Alternate OPA-A3	0					
Addenda Acknowledged	1-2 √					
Clarifications Acknowledged	1-3					
Bid Signature						
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)	✓	1			·	
Bid Bond Attached and Signed						
		£.				





Bid Package: 1220 Horizonal Louver Blinds

Commonwealth Blinds	The Original Blindman	Warco Construction					
NIA	NIA	NIA			XC Sec		
1							
				V			
<b>1</b>	<b>V</b>	<b>\</b>					
	NIA	NIA NIA	Commonwealth Blinds  The Original Blindman  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NI	NIA NIA NIA NIA	Commonwealth Blinds  The Original Blindman  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NI	Commonwealth Blinds The Original Blindman  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NI	Commonwealth Blinds  The Original Blindman  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NIA  NI



Bid Package: 2100 Fire Protection

Bidder	Elite F	ire Control Inc.	Fire Sprin	akler Service, LLC	Johnson (	Controls Inc.	Pye Barker Fire and Safety	The Hiller (	Companies, LLC			
Base Bid	No	BID	Νo	610	10	BID	11,747.00	NO	DID			
Alternate OPA-A1												
Alternate OPA-A2												
Alternate OPA-A3												
Addenda Acknowledged						į	1-2					
Clarifications Acknowledged							4046					
Bid Signature												
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)							40				~	
Bid Bond Attached and Signed				1		1						
									_			



Bid Package: 2200 Plumbing

Bidder	Full-Service Plumbing	PC Jackson Plumbing, Inc.				
Base Bid	to BID	120,180.00				
Alternate OPA-A1		NIA				
Alternate OPA-A2		NLA				
Alternate OPA-A3		N/A				
Addenda Acknowledged		1-2				
Clarifications Acknowledged		1-4 1				(*
Bid Signature						
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)		/				
Bid Bond Attached and Signed						



Bid Package: 2300 HVAC

Bidder	E2 Mechanical, LLC	Superior Mec Systems I	hanical	echanical Inc.				
Base Bid	640,785.00	No B	0 по	. Blo				
Alternate OPA-A1	NIA							
Alternate OPA-A2	N/A							
Alternate OPA-A3	N/A							
Addenda Acknowledged	1-2 /							
Clarifications Acknowledged	1-4 /							
Bid Signature								
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)	<b>✓</b>						92	
Bid Bond Attached and Signed		1		$\downarrow$				



Bid Package: 2600 Electrical & Fire Alarm

Bidder	Fountain Electric Services	Lake Electric Co.	Pye Barker Fire & Safety	Stelco Electric LLC	TEC Electric LLC			
Base Bid	No B10	415,300.00	NO BID	128,000.00	149,500.00			
Alternate OPA-A1		NA		MA	MA			
Alternate OPA-A2		NIA		N/A	NIA			
Alternate OPA-A3		N/A		N/A	NIA			
Addenda Acknowledged		1-2		1-2 -	1-2 1			
Clarifications Acknowledged		1-4 /		1-4	1-4 1		3	-
Bid Signature								
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)					✓			
Bid Bond Attached and Signed	· ·							
						•		



Bid Package: 2700 Communications

Bidder	Stelco Electric LLC				
Base Bid	46,300,00				
Alternate OPA-A1	Alu				
Alternate OPA-A2	ИІА				
Alternate OPA-A3	NIA				
Addenda Acknowledged	1-2				
Clarifications Acknowledged	1-4 /				
Bid Signature					
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)	<b>√</b>				
Bid Bond Attached and Signed					



Bid Package: 2800 Security Systems

Bidder	Access Services, Inc.	Diamond Electronics Inc.	Security Technology Group	Stelco Electric LLC	GLOSPI
Base Bid	Ne 010	70 BIO	ho BID	no BID	34, 920.00
Alternate OPA-A1			<b>\</b>		NIA
Alternate OPA-A2			a a		N/A
Alternate OPA-A3	1				N/A
Addenda Acknowledged					1-2 /
Clarifications Acknowledged					1-4
Bid Signature				8	
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and Notarized (Affidavit A & B - 2 pages)					
Bid Bond Attached and Signed					